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IMPORTANT
TURN OFF THE POWER AT THE MAIN FUSE 

OR CIRCUIT BREAKER BOX
BEFORE STARTING INSTALLATION

Socket
Assembly Bulb

(not included)

Mounting Screws

Shade

 Carefully unpack and identify all parts 
before assembly. Bulbs are not 
included.

1. Take fixture wire and ground wire 
exiting above center column and thread 
through, fixture plate, lock washer and 
hex nut. Lock all together by tightening 
hex nut. 

2. Install upper section of arms onto 
fixture plate by fastening with screw 
(short) and small hex nut.

3. Install a hex nut onto one end of long 
threaded stud leaving about 3/8" (10 
mm) thread exposed.  Screw same end 
of threaded stud into bottom of socket 
assembly. Tighten hex nut.

4. Follow enclosed supplement 
installation instructions for electrical 
and fixture installation onto house 
outlet box. If you do not have an outlet 
box at desired location to attach the 
fixture than hire a qualified electrician 
to create one.

5. Install light bulbs (not included). See 
relamping  label located near socket 
area for type and maximun allowed 
wattage.

6. Sit decorative pan on top of glass shade.  
Then while holding securely onto the 
glass shade, slide through the installed 
threaded pipe until pan touches bottom 
end of arms.  Secure into position by 
fastening with a flat washer and hex 
nut.  Afterward, slip cover and install 
finial by screwing onto protruding 
threaded pipe.

Pan

Flat Washer

Hex Nut

Finial

Cover

Mounting Plate

Arm

Ball Cap Nuts

Fixture Plate

Screw 
(short length)

Small 
Lock Washer

Threaded Pipe

Center
Column


